
  

            

  

 

 

 

 

AGENDA: 

1. Call the Meeting to Order 

2. Pledge of Allegiance to the Flag 

3. Roll Call 

4. Approval of the Agenda 

5. Citizen Comments – Agenda Items (limited to 3 minutes each) 

6. Citizen Comments – Non-Agenda Items (limited to 3 minutes each) 

7. CONSENT AGENDA 

a. Motion to Approve the Minutes of the September 8th meeting, the List of Bills Submitted and 

Resolution No. 0925-7 Approving Final Plat of McBurney’s Second Addition to Linn 

County  

8. NEW BUSINESS 

a. First Reading of Ordinance No. 2501 Approving Amendments to Future Land Use Map 

b. Public Hearing to Hear Questions and Concerns Regarding Amendments to the Future Land 

Use Map 

c. First Reading of Ordinance No. 2502, Amending Chapter 153 of the Robins Code of 

Ordinances, Plumbing Code 

d. First Reading of Ordinance No. 2503, Amending Chapter 154 of the Robins Code of 

Ordinances, Mechanical Code 

e. First Reading of Ordinance No. 2504, Amending Chapter 156 of the Robins Code of 

Ordinances, Electrical Code 

f. Resolution No. 0925-8 Setting a Public Hearing to Hear Questions and Concerns Regarding 

the Re-Zoning of Certain Properties within the Boundaries of the City of Robins 

g. Resolution No. 0925-9 Setting a Public Hearing to Hear Questions and Concerns Regarding 

Amendment No. 1 to the Fiscal Year 2026 Budget 

h. Resolution No. 0925-10 Approving the City of Robins Municipal Debris Management Plan 

9. OLD BUSINESS 

a. Five Year Capital Improvement Plan Continued Discussion and Possible Motion 

10. COUNCIL COMMENTS - During this portion of the meeting, Council members may bring 

forward communications, concerns and reports on various matters. The Council will not discuss, 

deliberate or take action on these matters at this time, but may include them on the agenda for future 

meetings 

11. MOTION TO ADJOURN MEETING 

ROBINS CITY COUNCIL 

Monday, September 22nd, 2025 

6:00 p.m. – Robins City Hall 
(ONE OR MORE MEMBERS OF THE COUNCIL MAY BE ATTENDING VIA ELECTRONIC DEVICE) 

 

TENTATIVE AGENDA 
 

 



  
Minutes of the September 8th, 2025 City Council Meeting 

*Unofficial meeting minutes until approved by Council* 

1 
 

The regular meeting of the Robins City Council was called to order at 6:00 p.m. on Monday, September 8, 

2025, at Robins City Hall, 265 S. 2nd Street, by Mayor Chuck Hinz. Following the Pledge of Allegiance, 

roll call was taken with all Council members present: Leigh Cook, Dave Franzman, Cary Smith (joining 

by phone), JD Smith, and Mike Foley. Also in attendance were City Clerk Lisa Goodin, City Attorney 

Maddie Huntzinger, City Engineer Kelli Scott, Zoning Administrator Vance McKinnon, Police Chief 

Andy Humphrey, Fire Chief Keith Feldkamp, Building Official/Public Works Superintendent, Public 

Works Deputy Superintendent/Fire Code Official Neal Boeckmann and Deputy City Clerk Rhonda 

Kortenkamp. A motion to approve the agenda was made by Councilor Franzman, seconded by Councilor 

Foley, and carried unanimously. 

 

COUNCIL REPORTS: Mayor Hinz reported that City staff and Council members have been working on 

updating the City’s 5 Year CIP, which should be ready for approval at the October 6th regular city council 

meeting. Hinz recommended to table Resolution No.’s 0925-3, 0925-4 and 0925-5 on the evening’s 

agenda, as legal counsel was still formulating its recommendations. In Council reports, Councilor Foley 

shared that the Fire Department had responded to 12 calls in August and completed water operations 

training. The Police Department recorded 103 activity initiations and noted an increase in speeding 

violations. Foley further reported that three candidates for the full-time police officer had been 

interviewed. Councilor Cary Smith reported that the West Main St. roadway improvements had been 

delayed until September 22nd. City Staff has recommended that N. Center Point Rd from Wild Rose Rd to 

W. Main St. be re-surfaced ahead of the W. Main St. Reconstruction, further recommending that N. 

Center Point Rd. be scheduled for fiscal year 2028 and W. Main St. be moved out to fiscal year 2029.  

Smith added that quotes were being secured to repair deficiencies found in 3 City bridges. Councilor 

Cook reported that the public hearing date for the FY26 Budget Amendment would be set at the 

September 22nd regular Council meeting. Councilor Franzman reported that work continued on the 

Memorial Donation policy and that he expected fees to align with the City of Marion’s donation policy. 

Councilor JD Smith stated the Maple St. and Northwest sewer lift stations continue to cycle too 

frequently, indicating that incorrectly directed sump pumps are the likely culprit. 

 

STAFF REPORTS: City Engineer Kelli Scott echoed Councilor Cary Smith’s report, stating that the N. 

Mentzer Rd. bridge was in need of $100,000 in repairs. Bids for repairs on the S. Troy Rd. and W, Main 

St. bridges are pending. She added that the re-surfacing of the section of N. Center Point Rd from W. 

Main St. to County Home Rd. would be eligible for MPO funding in FY30 – FY34.  Zoning 

Administrator Vance McKinnon reported that one new home permit was issued in August, bringing the 

total number of new homes permitted in 2025 to 25. 

 

CITIZENS COMMENTS: none 

 

CONSENT AGENDA: The Consent Agenda, which included approval of the August 18 & August 25th 

2025 City Council Meeting minutes, the list of bills submitted and Resolution No. 0925-6 Approving Tax 

Abatement Application for 3201 Eagle View Ct was approved following a motion by Councilor Cook to 

approve the agenda in accordance with Hinz’s recommendations, seconded by Councilor JD Smith, with 

all members voting in favor. 

 



2 

NEW BUSINESS: Representatives of Xavier Schools President Chris McCarville, Pat Deignan, Finance 

Committee Chairperson and Dean Spina, Attorney with Bradley Riley were present. Mr. Spina to detailed 

Xavier Schools’ request that the City issue a $10M revenue bond to assist in the construction of new 

middle school facilities. Mr. McCarville described Xavier’s efforts to purchase and remodel the former 

Toyota Financial building, including the addition of indoor and outdoor extra-curricular spaces. The total 

project cost is estimated to be $45M. If Robins were to issue a $10M on their behalf, the City’s debt limit 

would be unaffected, Xavier would be responsible for the re-payment of the bond and no funds would be 

transmitted through the City’s financial system. By employing Robins’ revenue bond issuance capacity, 

Xavier would save approximately $100,000 in interest payments. Franzman motioned to approve 

Resolution No. 0925-1 Authorizing the Execution of a Memorandum of Agreement with Xavier Schools, 

Cedar Rapids, Iowa and Fixing a Date for a Hearing on the Proposed Issuance of Private School 

Revenue Bonds (Xavier School Project), Series 2025 in Oner or More Series. Councilor JD Smith 

seconded and upon a roll call, the votes were as follows: JD Smith – aye, Franzman – aye, Cary Smith – 

aye, Cook – aye, Foley – nay. The resolution passed. 

On the issue of Resolution No. 0925-2 Setting a Public Hearing for September 22, 2025 for Questions 

and Concerns Relating to Proposed Updates to the Future Land Use Map, Councilor JD Smith motioned 

for approval, with Franzman seconding. Upon roll call, all votes were aye. The resolution passed. 

 

OLD BUSINESS: Council briefly discussed the W. Main St. Reconstruction, where Engineer Scott 

detailed City staff’s recommendation to push the project to FY29 in order to allow for N. Center Point Rd. 

from Wild Rose Rd. to W. Main St. to be re-surfaced in FY28. Foley motioned approval for the project to 

begin in FY29 and directed City staff to coordinate a contract amendment with Snyder & Associates as 

necessary to meet the new schedule. Cook seconded and all votes were aye. The continued work on the 5 

Year CIP was described by Clerk Goodin and Engineer Scott, highlighting forecasts by City staff 

identifying the maximum funds available for reserve fund dedication. Foley suggested the City consider 

bonding on a regular schedule allowing staff and Council members to better plan for future capital 

purchases and projects. A bond sale in FY27 was discussed, with near-term needs being identified. 

 

COUNCIL COMMENTS: Councilor JD Smith commented that the tabling of three resolutions on the 

agenda did not make him happy, as these addressed three on-going staff compensation issues and should 

be delayed no further. Hinz assured him that the issues would be on the next Council agenda following a 

meeting with and recommendations by the City Attorney. 

 

ADJOURNMENT:  The meeting adjourned at 8:14 p.m. following a motion by Councilor JD Smith, 

seconded by Councilor Foley. The motion carried unanimously 

 

    

         

   Chuck Hinz, Mayor 

ATTEST: 

 

 

Lisa Goodin, City Clerk/Treasurer 



Wed Sep 17, 2025 11:43 AM CLAIMS REPORT Page     1
                                              Vendor Checks:  9/09/2025- 9/22/2025 Payroll Checks:  9/09/2025- 9/22/2025         
                                                                                                                                                        

APCLAIRP 04.22.22  City of Robins IA                                                    OPER: L G



Wed Sep 17, 2025 11:43 AM CLAIMS REPORT Page     2
                                              Vendor Checks:  9/09/2025- 9/22/2025 Payroll Checks:  9/09/2025- 9/22/2025         
                                                                                                                                                        

APCLAIRP 04.22.22  City of Robins IA                                                    OPER: L G



Wed Sep 17, 2025 11:43 AM CLAIMS REPORT Page     3
                                              Vendor Checks:  9/09/2025- 9/22/2025 Payroll Checks:  9/09/2025- 9/22/2025         
                                                                                                                                                        

APCLAIRP 04.22.22  City of Robins IA                                                    OPER: L G



Wed Sep 17, 2025 11:43 AM CLAIMS REPORT Page     4
                                              Vendor Checks:  9/09/2025- 9/22/2025 Payroll Checks:  9/09/2025- 9/22/2025         
                                                                                                                                                        

APCLAIRP 04.22.22  City of Robins IA                                                    OPER: L G



Wed Sep 17, 2025 11:43 AM CLAIMS REPORT Page     5
                                              CLAIMS FUND SUMMARY Payroll Checks:  9/09/2025- 9/22/2025         
                                                                                                                                                        

APCLAIRP 04.22.22  City of Robins IA                                                    OPER: L G



Wed Sep 17, 2025 12:06 PM BUDGET REPORT Page     1
                                              CALENDAR  9/2025, FISCAL  3/2026                                               
                                              PCT OF FISCAL YTD  25.0%                      

GLBUDGRP 07/01/21  OPER: L G CITY OF ROBINS                                              Statement Writer: 00   Report Format: EXPENSES              



Wed Sep 17, 2025 12:06 PM BUDGET REPORT Page     2
                                              CALENDAR  9/2025, FISCAL  3/2026                                               
                                              PCT OF FISCAL YTD  25.0%                      

GLBUDGRP 07/01/21  OPER: L G CITY OF ROBINS                                              Statement Writer: 00   Report Format: EXPENSES              



Wed Sep 17, 2025 12:07 PM BUDGET REPORT Page     3
                                              CALENDAR  9/2025, FISCAL  3/2026                                               
                                              PCT OF FISCAL YTD  25.0%                      

GLBUDGRP 07/01/21  OPER: L G CITY OF ROBINS                                              Statement Writer: 00   Report Format: EXPENSES              



Wed Sep 17, 2025 12:07 PM BUDGET REPORT Page     4
                                              CALENDAR  9/2025, FISCAL  3/2026                                               
                                              PCT OF FISCAL YTD  25.0%                      

GLBUDGRP 07/01/21  OPER: L G CITY OF ROBINS                                              Statement Writer: 00   Report Format: EXPENSES              



Wed Sep 17, 2025 12:07 PM BUDGET REPORT Page     5
                                              CALENDAR  9/2025, FISCAL  3/2026                                               
                                              PCT OF FISCAL YTD  25.0%                      

GLBUDGRP 07/01/21  OPER: L G CITY OF ROBINS                                              Statement Writer: 00   Report Format: EXPENSES              



Wed Sep 17, 2025 12:07 PM BUDGET REPORT Page     6
                                              CALENDAR  9/2025, FISCAL  3/2026                                               
                                              PCT OF FISCAL YTD  25.0%                      

GLBUDGRP 07/01/21  OPER: L G CITY OF ROBINS                                              Statement Writer: 00   Report Format: EXPENSES              



Wed Sep 17, 2025 12:07 PM BUDGET REPORT Page     7
                                              CALENDAR  9/2025, FISCAL  3/2026                                               
                                              PCT OF FISCAL YTD  25.0%                      

GLBUDGRP 07/01/21  OPER: L G CITY OF ROBINS                                              Statement Writer: 00   Report Format: EXPENSES              



Wed Sep 17, 2025 12:07 PM BUDGET REPORT Page     8
                                              CALENDAR  9/2025, FISCAL  3/2026                                               
                                              PCT OF FISCAL YTD  25.0%                      

GLBUDGRP 07/01/21  OPER: L G CITY OF ROBINS                                              Statement Writer: 00   Report Format: EXPENSES              



Wed Sep 17, 2025 12:07 PM BUDGET REPORT Page     9
                                              CALENDAR  9/2025, FISCAL  3/2026                                               
                                              PCT OF FISCAL YTD  25.0%                      

GLBUDGRP 07/01/21  OPER: L G CITY OF ROBINS                                              Statement Writer: 00   Report Format: EXPENSES              



Wed Sep 17, 2025 12:07 PM BUDGET REPORT Page    10
                                              CALENDAR  9/2025, FISCAL  3/2026                                               
                                              PCT OF FISCAL YTD  25.0%                      

GLBUDGRP 07/01/21  OPER: L G CITY OF ROBINS                                              Statement Writer: 00   Report Format: EXPENSES              



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

RESOLUTION NO. 0925-7 

APPROVING FINAL PLAT OF MCBURNEY’S SECOND ADDITION TO  

LINN COUNTY, IOWA 

 

WHEREAS, A PLAT OF MCBURNEY’S SECOND ADDITION TO LINN COUNTY, IOWA has 

been filed with the City Clerk and after consideration of the same is found to be correct and in 

accordance with the provisions of the laws of the State of Iowa, and the ordinances of the City of 

Robins, in relation to Plats and Additions to Cities, 

 

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ROBINS, 

IOWA, that said plat and dedication of said McBurney’s Second Addition to Linn County, Iowa, be 

and the same is hereby acknowledged and approved on the part of the City of Robins, Iowa and the 

Mayor and the City Clerk are hereby directed to certify this resolution of approval and affix the same 

to said plat as by law provided. 

 

Passed this 19th day of May AD, 2025. 

 ________________________________ 

 Chuck Hinz, Mayor 

ATTEST: 

 

_________________________________ 

Lisa Goodin, City Clerk/Treasurer 

 

STATE OF IOWA ) 

 ) SS 

LINN COUNTY ) 

 

We Chuck Hinz, Mayor, and Lisa Goodin, City Clerk of the City of Robins, Iowa, do hereby certify 

that the above and foregoing resolution is a true and correct copy of the resolution as passed by the 

City Council of the City of Robins, Iowa on this 19th day of May AD, 2025 

. 

 _________________________________ 

 Chuck Hinz, Mayor 

 

 _________________________________ 

 Lisa Goodin, City Clerk/Treasurer 









 

 

ORDINANCE NO. 2501 

 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING THE FUTURE LAND USE MAP OF CHAPTER 165 OF THE ROBINS 

MUNICIPAL CODE, CITY OF ROBINS, IOWA 

 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ROBINS, IOWA, that the Municipal Code 

of the City of Robins, Iowa, is amended as follows: 

 

 

SECTION 1. That the Future Land Use Map adopted on 20th day of June 2022 be repealed and 

the attached new Future Land Use map with the plot date of September 8th, 2025 

be enacted. 

 

SECTION 2. That the changes provided in this Ordinance shall be made a part of the 

replacement pages of the Municipal Code, City of Robins, Iowa, and made a part 

of said Code as provided by law. 

 

SECTION 3. Effective Date.  That this Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after 

its passage and publication as provided by law. 

 

 

PASSED AND APPROVED, this __th day of _____, 2025. 

 

 

 

 

 

              

        Chuck Hinz, Mayor 

ATTEST: 

 

 

 

 

     

Lisa Goodin, City Clerk/Treasurer  

 

 





 

 

ORDINANCE NO. 2502 

 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 153, PLUMBING 

CODE, OF THE ROBINS MUNICIPAL CODE, ROBINS, IOWA 

 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ROBINS, IOWA, that the Municipal Code 

of the City of Robins, Iowa is amended as follows: 

 

SECTION 1: Chapter 153 “Table of Contents” for “Chapter 153 – PLUMBING CODE” is amended by 

deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

CHAPTER 153 

PLUMBING CODE 
 

153.01 Plumbing Code Adopted 153.10 Exception (Backwater Valve) 

153.02 Amendments to the Plumbing 
Code 

153.11 Gas Pipe Joints 

153.03 Conflicts 153.12 Fuel Gas Pipe Location 

153.04 International Fuel Gas Code 153.13 Water Heater Pan Drain 
Termination 

153.05 Schedule of Fees 153.14 Cross Connection Control 

153.06 Expiration 153.15 Frost Closure 

153.07 Extensions 153.16 Subsurface Landscape 
Irrigation Systems 

153.08 Violations 153.17 Code on File 

153.09 Board of Appeals                153.18 Licensing of Plumbers 

  

SECTION 2: Chapter 153.01 “Plumbing Code Adopted” for “Chapter 153 – PLUMBING CODE” is 

amended by deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

153.01 PLUMBING CODE ADOPTED. Except as hereinafter added to, deleted, modified or amended, 

there is hereby adopted as the Plumbing Code of the City that certain Plumbing Code known as the International 

Plumbing Code, 2024 Edition Administrative Provisions, as prepared and edited by the International Code 

Council, and the State of Iowa Plumbing Code, is hereby specifically incorporated and shall be known as the 

Robins Plumbing Code. The provisions of said Plumbing Code shall be controlling in the erection, installation, 

alterations, additions, repair, relocation, replacement, maintenance or use of any plumbing system within the 

corporate limits of the City. 

 

SECTION 3: Chapter 153.04 “International Fuel Gas Code” for “Chapter 153 – PLUMBING CODE” is 

amended by deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

153.04 INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE. The Robins Plumbing Code is hereby amended by adding 

a new Section 101.2.1 to the International Plumbing Code, Administrative provisions as follows: 

101.2.1 The International Fuel Gas Code, 2024 Edition, as further amended is hereby adopted and shall 

be considered as part of this code. 



 

 

SECTION 4: Chapter 153.05 “Schedule of Fees” for “Chapter 153 – PLUMBING CODE” is amended by 

deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

153.05 SCHEDULE OF FEES. The Robins Plumbing Code is hereby amended by repealing Section 108.2 of 

the International Plumbing Code, 2024 Edition, and replacing said section with a new Section 108.2 as follows: 

108.2 The fees for all plumbing work shall be as set forth in Table P-1 as adopted by resolution of the 

Robins City Council. 

 

SECTION 5: Chapter 153.06 “Expiration” for “Chapter 153 – PLUMBING CODE” is amended by deleting 

the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

153.06 EXPIRATION. The Robins Plumbing Code is hereby amended by adding a new Section 105.5.3.1 

to the International Plumbing Code, 2024 Edition as Follows: 

105.5.3.1 EXPIRATION.  Every plumbing permit issued under the provisions of the Code shall expire 

twenty-four (24) months from the date of issue, unless the application is accompanied by a construction 

schedule of specific longer duration, in which instance the permit may be issued for the term of the 

construction schedule. If the work has not been completed by the expiration date of the permit, no further 

work shall be done until the permit shall have been renewed by the owner or his or her agent and by 

payment of the new permit fee as set forth in Table 3-A SCHEDULE OF FEES as adopted by resolution 

of the Robins City Council and provided no changes have been made in plans or location. No permit 

shall be renewed. 

 

SECTION 6: The Robins Plumbing Code is hereby amended adding a new section 105.5.4 to the International 

Plumbing Code, 2024 Edition as Follows: 

105.5.4 EXTENSIONS.  Any permittee holding an unexpired permit shall have the right to apply for an 

extension of the time within which the permittee will commence work under that permit when work is 

unable to be commenced within the time required by this section for good and satisfactory reasons. The 

code official shall extend the time for action by the permittee for a period not exceeding 180 days if there 

is reasonable cause. A permit shall not be extended more than once. Payment of the permit extension 

shall be as set forth in Table 3-A, SCHEDULE OF FEES, as adopted by resolution of the Robins City 

Council. 

 

SECTION 7: Chapter 153.07 “Violations” for “Chapter 153 – PLUMBING CODE” is amended by deleting 

the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

153.08 VIOLATIONS. The Robins Plumbing Code is hereby amended by adding a new Section 115.4.1 to 

the International Plumbing Code Administrative provisions, as follows: 

115.4.1 PENALTIES. Specifics of information for Section 108, Violations, shall be as set forth in 

City of Robins Code of Ordinances Chapter 3. 

 

SECTION 8: Chapter 153.08 “Board of Appeals” for “Chapter 153 – PLUMBING CODE” is amended by 

deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

153.09  BOARD OF APPEALS. The Robins Plumbing Code is hereby amended by repealing Section 113 

of the International Plumbing Code Administrative Provisions, 2024 Edition, and replacing said section with 



 

new Section 113 as follows: 

113 BOARD OF APPEALS. In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or determinations 

made by the Building Official relative to the application and interpretation of this Code, there shall be 

and is hereby created a Board of Appeals, consisting of the members of the Construction Codes Review 

Board as established in City of Robins Code of Ordinances Section 155.12. The Building Official or 

designated representative shall be an ex-officio member without a vote and shall act as secretary of the 

Board. 

The Board shall adopt reasonable rules and regulations for conducting its investigations and shall render 

all decisions and findings in writing to the Building Official with a duplicate copy to the appellant and 

may recommend to the City Council such new legislation as is consistent therewith. The Board shall 

hold a regular meeting on the fourth Tuesday of each month, unless there are no appeals or business on 

file for a hearing. 

Nominal appeal fee to the Board of Appeals shall be paid as set forth in Table P-1 SCHEDULE OF 

FEES as adopted by resolution of the City Council. The appeal shall be valid for one (1) year from the 

date of the Board approval to the commencement of work and to the completion of work undertaken 

pursuant to the approval. 

The Board shall have no authority of interpretation of the administration of this code, nor shall such 

board be empowered to waive requirements of this code. 

 

SECTION 9: Chapter 153.09 “Exception (Backwater Valve)” for “Chapter 153 – PLUMBING CODE” is 

amended by deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

153.10 EXCEPTION (BACKWATER VALVE). The Robins Plumbing Code is hereby amended by 

adding a new exception to Section 602.3 of the State of Iowa Plumbing Code, as follows: 

EXCEPTION: The requirements of this section shall apply only at locations determined necessary by 

the City Engineer based on local conditions. 

 

SECTION 10: Chapter 153.10 “Gas Pipe Joints” for “Chapter 153 – PLUMBING CODE” is amended by 

deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

153.11 GAS PIPE JOINTS. The Robins Plumbing Code is hereby amended by adding a new Section 403.9.1.1 

to the International Fuel Gas Code, 2024 Edition, as follows: 

403.9.1.1 PIPE JOINTS. All joints of wrought iron steel gas piping larger than two inches (2") standard 

iron pipe size or providing gas pressure greater than two (2) PSIG shall be welded steel. All welded 

joints shall comply with the State of Iowa requirements and the work shall be performed by certified 

welders, whose current certification is on file with the City of Robins. 

 

SECTION 11: Chapter 153.11 “Fuel Gas Pipe Location” for “Chapter 153 – PLUMBING CODE” is 

amended by deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

153.12 FUEL GAS PIPE LOCATION. The Robins Plumbing Code is hereby amended by deleting Section 

404.3 from the International Fuel Gas Code, 2024 Edition, and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

404.3 PROHIBITED LOCATIONS. Piping shall not be installed in or through a duct supply, return or 

exhaust, or a clothes chute, chimney or gas vent, dumbwaiter, or elevator shaft. 

 

SECTION 12: Chapter 153.12 “Water Heater Pan Drain Termination” for “Chapter 153 – PLUMBING 



 

CODE” is amended by deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

153.13 WATER HEATER PAN DRAIN TERMINATION. The Robins Plumbing Code is hereby amended 

by adding Section 507.5.1 to the State of Iowa Plumbing Code, as follows: 

507.5.1 PAN DRAIN TERMINATION. The pan drain shall extend full size and terminate over a 

suitably located indirect waste receptor or floor drain or extend to the exterior of the building and 

terminate not less than 6 inches and not more than 24 inches above the adjacent ground surface. Where 

a pan drain was not previously installed, the Code Official may approve installation of a replacement 

water heater without a pan drain. 

 

SECTION 13: Chapter 153.13 “Cross Connection Control” for “Chapter 153 – PLUMBING CODE” is 

amended by deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

153.14 CROSS CONNECTION CONTROL. The Robins Plumbing Code is hereby amended by adding a new 

Section 603.1.1 to the State of Iowa Plumbing Code as follows: 

603.1.1 For the purposes of Section 603 State of Iowa Plumbing Code, of the Robins Plumbing Code 

only, the Administrative Authority is the Cedar Rapids Water Department as authorized by City of 

Robins Council. 

The Administrative Authority may create such rules and policy as necessary to implement the provisions 

of this section. 

 

SECTION 14: Chapter 153.14 “Frost Closure” for “Chapter 153 – PLUMBING CODE” is amended by 

deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

153.15 FROST CLOSURE. The Robins Plumbing Code is hereby amended by deleting Section 906.7 from 

the State of Iowa Plumbing Code, and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

906.7 FROST CLOSURE. Where the 97.5-percent value for outside design temperature is 0ºF or less, 

every vent extension through a roof or wall shall be not less than 3 inches in diameter. Any increase in 

the size of the vent shall be made inside the structure at a point not less than 1 foot below the roof or 

inside the wall. Roof extensions shall terminate by extending above the roof a minimum of 12”. 

 

SECTION 15: Chapter 153.15 “Subsurface Landscape Irrigation Systems” for “Chapter 153 – 

PLUMBING CODE” is amended by deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

153.16 SUBSURFACE LANDSCAPE IRRIGATION SYSTEMS.  The Robins Plumbing 

Code is hereby amended by deleting Section 1501.1 in its entirety from the State of Iowa Plumbing Code, and 

inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

1501.1 SCOPE. The provisions of Chapter 15 shall be optional and for information only of the 

materials, design, construction, and installation of subsurface landscape irrigation system connected to 

non-potable water from on-site water reuse systems. 

 

SECTION 16: Chapter 153.16 “Code on File” for “Chapter 153 – PLUMBING CODE” is amended by 

deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

153.17 CODE ON FILE. An official copy of the Robins Plumbing Code hereby adopted, including a 

certificate by the Clerk as to its adoption and the effective date thereof, is on file in the office of the Clerk in City 

Hall and shall be kept there on file, and copies shall be available for public inspection.   

 



 

SECTION 17: The Robins Plumbing Code is hereby amended adding a new section as Follows: 

 

153.18 LICENSING OF PLUMBERS. 

 

1. Title and purpose. This section shall be known as the "City of Robins, Iowa, Plumbing 

Contractors, Journeyman Plumbers and Pipe Layers Licensing Code." The purpose of this section is 

to provide for the licensing and insuring of plumbing contractors, journeymen and pipe layers in 

order to protect public health, safety and welfare. 

2. Licensing required. No person shall install, alter, and add to, repair, relocate, replace or maintain 

any plumbing system within the City unless such person meets the requirements of licensing rules as 

established by the Iowa Department of Inspections Appeals, and Licenses Plumbing and Mechanical 

Systems Examining Board, and has obtained a permit for said plumbing work from the Building 

Official according to the provisions of the Robins Plumbing Code. 

3. Violations. Violations of this section shall be punished as provided in 1.14 of the Code of 

Ordinances or may be cited as a municipal infraction under Chapter 3 of the Code of Ordinances. 

 

SECTION 18: Repealed. All Ordinances or parts thereof in conflict with the provisions of the Ordinance are 

repealed. 

 

SECTION 19: Severability. If any section, provision, or part of the Ordinance shall be adjudged invalid or 

unconstitutional, such adjudication shall not affect the validity of the Ordinance as a whole or ay section, 

provision, or part thereof not adjudged invalid or unconstitutional. 

 

SECTION 20:  Effective Date. This Ordinance shall be in effect from and after its final passage, approval, and 

publication as provided by law. 

 

PASSED AND APPROVED this _____ day of ________ 2025 

 

___________________________ 

Chuck Hinz, Mayor 

ATTEST: 

 

________________________ 

Lisa Goodin, City Clerk/Treasurer 



 

 

ORDINANCE NO. 2503 

 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 154, MECHANICAL 

CODE, OF THE ROBINS MUNICIPAL CODE, ROBINS, IOWA 

 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ROBINS, IOWA, that the Municipal Code 

of the City of Robins, Iowa is amended as follows: 

 

SECTION 1: Chapter 154 “Table of Contents” for “Chapter 154 – MECHANICAL CODE” is amended by 

deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

CHAPTER 154 

MECHANICAL CODE 

 
154.01 Mechanical Code Adopted 154.07 Expiration 
154.02 Amendments to the Mechanical 
Code 

154.08 Board of Appeals 

154.03 Conflicts 154.09 Gas Pipe Joints 
154.04 International Fuel Gas Code 154.10 Fuel Gas Pipe 

Location 
154.05 Permit Fees 154.11 Code on File 

154.12 Licensing of 
Mechanical Contractors 

154.06 Violation  

 

SECTION 2: Chapter 154.01 “Mechanical Code Adopted” for “Chapter 154 – MECHANICAL CODE” is 

amended by deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

154.01 MECHANICAL CODE ADOPTED. Except as hereinafter added to, deleted, modified or amended, 

there is hereby adopted as the Mechanical Code of the City that certain Mechanical Code known as the 

International Mechanical Code, 2024 Edition, as prepared and published by the International Code Council, 

which code is hereby specifically incorporated by reference and shall be known as the Robins Mechanical Code. 

The provisions of said Mechanical Code shall be controlling in the erection, installation, alteration, repair, 

relocation, replacement, addition to, use, maintenance or removal of heating, ventilation, cooling or 

refrigerating systems, incinerators or other miscellaneous heat-producing or refrigerating appliances and in all 

matters covered by said Mechanical Code within the corporate limits of the City. 

 

SECTION 3: Chapter 154.02 “Amendments to the Mechanical Code” for “Chapter 154 – MECHANICAL 

CODE” is amended by deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

154.02 AMENDMENTS TO THE MECHANICAL CODE. Certain sections of the International 

Mechanical Code, 2024 Edition, are hereby amended, deleted, modified or added to as more specifically set 

forth in the following sections of this chapter. 

 

SECTION 4: Chapter 154.04 “International Fuel Gas Code” for “Chapter 154 – MECHANICAL CODE” 

is amended by deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

154.04 INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE. The Robins Mechanical Code is hereby amended by 

adding a new Section 101.2.7 to the International Fuel Gas Code as follows: 



 

 

101.2.2 The International Fuel Gas Code, 2024 Edition, as further amended is hereby adopted and 

shall be considered as part of this code. 

 

SECTION 5: Chapter 154.05 “Permit Fees” for “Chapter 154 – MECHANICAL CODE” is amended by 

deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

154.05 PERMIT FEES. The Robins Mechanical Code is hereby amended by deleting Section 109.2 108.2 

from the International Mechanical Code, 2024 Edition, and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

109.2108.2 SCHEDULE OF PERMIT FEES. Where work requires a permit, a fee for each permit 

shall be paid as required in accordance with the schedule as established as set forth in Table M-1, 

Mechanical Fees, as adopted by resolution of the City of Robins Council. 

 

SECTION 6: Chapter 154.06 “Permit Fees” for “Chapter 154 – MECHANICAL CODE” is amended by 

deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

154.06  VIOLATION. The Robins Mechanical Code is hereby amended by deleting Section 114.4 of the 

International Mechanical Code in its entirety and replacing it with the following: 

114.4 Violations. Any person who violates a provision of this Code or who shall fail to comply with 

any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter or repair plumbing work in violation of 

the approved construction documents or directive of the Code Official, or of a permit or certificate 

issued under the provisions of this Code, shall be subject to the provisions of City of Robins Code of 

Ordinances Chapter 1, Article 14. 

 

SECTION 7: Chapter 154.07 “Expiration” for “Chapter 154 – MECHANICAL CODE” is amended by 

deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

154.07  EXPIRATION. The Robins Mechanical Code is hereby amended by adding a new Section 105.4.3 

to the International Mechanical Code, 2024 Edition as Follows: 

105.4.3 EXPIRATION. Every Mechanical permit issued under the provisions of the Code shall 

expire twenty-four (24) months from the date of issue, unless the application is accompanied by a 

construction schedule of specific longer duration, in which instance the permit may be issued for the 

term of the construction schedule. If the work has not been completed by the expiration date of the 

permit, no further work shall be done until the permit shall have been renewed by the owner or his or 

her agent and by payment of the new permit fee as set forth in Table 1-A SCHEDULE OF FEES as 

adopted by resolution of the Robins City Council and provided no changes have been made in plans or 

location. No permit shall be renewed. 

 

SECTION 8: Chapter 154.08 “Board of Appeals” for “Chapter 154 – MECHANICAL CODE” is amended 

by deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

154.08 BOARD OF APPEALS. The Robins Mechanical Code is hereby amended by repealing Section 113 

from the International Mechanical Code, and by replacing said section with a new section as follows: 

113 BOARD OF APPEALS. In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or 

determinations made by the Building Official relative to the application and interpretation of this 

Code, there shall be and is hereby created a Board of Appeals, consisting of the members of the 



 

 

Construction Codes Review Board as established in City of Robins Code of Ordinances Section 

155.12. The Building Official or designated representative shall be an ex-officio member without 

a vote and shall act as secretary of the Board. 

The Board shall adopt reasonable rules and regulations for conducting its investigations and shall 

render all decisions and findings in writing to the Building Official with a duplicate copy to the 

appellant and may recommend to the City Council such new legislation as is consistent therewith. 

The Board shall hold a regular meeting on the fourth Tuesday of each month, unless there are no 

appeals or business on file for a hearing. 

Nominal appeal fee to the Board of Appeals shall be paid as set forth in Table M-1 SCHEDULE OF 

FEES as adopted by resolution of the City Council. The appeal shall be valid for one (1) year from the 

date of the Board approval to the commencement of work and to the completion of work undertaken 

pursuant to the approval. 

The Board shall have no authority to interpretation of the administration of this code nor shall 

such board be empowered to waive requirements of this code. 

 

SECTION 09: Chapter 154.09 “Gas Pipe Joints” for “Chapter 154 – MECHANICAL CODE” is amended 

by deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

154.09 GAS PIPE JOINTS. The Robins Mechanical Code is hereby amended by adding a new Section 

403.9.1.1 to the International Fuel Gas Code, 2024 Edition, as follows: 

403.9.1.1 PIPE JOINTS. All joints of wrought iron steel gas piping larger than two inches (2") 

standard iron pipe size or providing gas pressure greater than two (2) PSIG shall be welded steel. All 

welded joints shall comply with the State of Iowa requirements and the work shall be performed by 

certified welders, whose current certification is on file with the City of Robins. 

 

SECTION 10: Chapter 154.10 “Fuel Gas Pipe Location” for “Chapter 154 – MECHANICAL CODE” is 

amended by deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

154.10 FUEL GAS PIPE LOCATION. The Robins Mechanical Code is hereby amended by deleting 

Section 404.3 from the International Fuel Gas Code, 2024 Edition, and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

404.3 PROHIBITED LOCATIONS. Piping shall not be installed in or through a duct supply, return or 

exhaust, or a clothes chute, chimney or gas vent, dumbwaiter, or elevator shaft. 

 

SECTION 11: The Robins Mechanical Code is hereby amended by adding a new Section 

 

154.12 LICENSING OF MECHANICAL CONTRACTORS. 

 

1. Title and purpose. This section shall be known as the "City of Robins, Iowa, Mechanical 

Heating/Cooling Licensing Code." The purpose of this section is to provide for the licensing and insuring 

of heating/cooling apprentices, journeymen/installers and contractors in order to protect public health, 

safety and welfare. 

2. Licensing required. No person shall install, alter, and add to, repair, relocate, replace or maintain any 

mechanical system within the City unless such person meets the requirements of licensing rules as 

established by the Iowa Department of Inspections, Appeals, and Licensing Plumbing and Mechanical 

Systems Examining Board, and has obtained a permit for said mechanical work from the Building 

Official according to the provisions of the Robins Mechanical Code. 

3. Violations. Violations of this section shall be punished as provided in section 1.14 of the Code of 



 

 

Ordinances or may be cited as a municipal infraction under Chapter 3 of the Code of Ordinances. 

 

SECTION 12: Repealed. All Ordinances or parts thereof in conflict with the provisions of the Ordinance are 

repealed. 

 

SECTION 13: Severability. If any section, provision, or part of the Ordinance shall be adjudged invalid or 

unconstitutional, such adjudication shall not affect the validity of the Ordinance as a whole or ay section, 

provision, or part thereof not adjudged invalid or unconstitutional. 

 

SECTION 14:  Effective Date. This Ordinance shall be in effect from and after its final passage, approval, and 

publication as provided by law. 

 

PASSED AND APPROVED this _____ day of ________ 2025 

 

___________________________ 

Chuck Hinz, Mayor 

ATTEST: 

 

________________________ 

Lisa Goodin, City Clerk/Treasurer 

 

 



 

 

ORDINANCE NO. 2504  

 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 156, 

ELECTRICAL CODE, OF THE ROBINS 

MUNICIPAL CODE, ROBINS, IOWA 

 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ROBINS, IOWA, that the 

Municipal Code of the City of Robins, Iowa is amended as follows: 

 

SECTION 1: Chapter 156 “Table of Contents” for “Chapter 156 – ELECTRICAL CODE” 

is amended by deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

CHAPTER 156 

 

ELECTRICAL CODE 
156.01 ICC Electrical Code & National Electrical 

Code Adopted 
156.08 Clear Space 

156.02 Amendments to the Electrical Code 156.09 Dwelling Units 

156.03 Schedule of Fees 156.10 Specific Appliances 

156.04 Expiration 156.11 Services 

156.05 Penalties 156.12 Conflicts 

156.06 Electrical Board of Appeals 156.13 Licensing of Electricians 

156.07 Smoke Alarms and Carbon Monoxide 

Alarms 

 

 

SECTION 2: Chapter 156.03 “Schedule of Permit Fees” for “Chapter 156 – ELECTRICAL 

CODE” is amended by deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

156.03 SCHEDULE OF PERMIT FEES. 

 

The Robins Electrical Code is hereby amended by deleting Section 404.2 of the ICC 

Electrical Code—Administrative Provisions and replacing said section with a new 

section as follows: 

 

SECTION 404.2.  Schedule of Permit Fees.  A fee for each permit shall be paid 

as required, in accordance with Schedule E-1 SCHEDULE OF FEES as 

adopted by resolution. 

 

SECTION 3: Chapter 156.05 “Penalties” for “Chapter 156 – ELECTRICAL CODE” is 

amended by deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

156.05 PENALTIES. 

 



 

 

The Robins Electrical Code is hereby amended by deleting Section 1003.1 to ICC 

Electrical Code--Administrative Provisions and replacing said section with a new section 

as follows: 

SECTION 1003.1. PENALTIES.   Any person who fails to comply with the 

provisions of this code or who fails to carry out an order made pursuant to this code 

or violates any condition attached to a permit, approval or certificate shall be subject 

to enforcement and penalties as provided section 1.14 of the Code of Ordinances or 

may be cited as a municipal infraction under chapter 3 of the Code of Ordinances. 

 

SECTION 4: Chapter 156.06 “Electrical Board of Appeals” for “Chapter 156 – 

ELECTRICAL CODE” is amended by deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the 

following: 

 

156.06 ELECTRICAL BOARD OF APPEALS. 

 
The Robins Electrical Code is hereby amended by deleting Chapter 11, Means of Appeal 
of the ICC Electrical Code--Administrative Provisions and inserting in lieu thereof the 

following: 
CHAPTER 11 MEANS OF APPEAL.  In order to hear and decide appeals of 
orders, decisions or determinations made by the building official relative to the 
application and interpretation of this Code, there shall be and is hereby created a 
Board of Appeals, consisting of the members of the Construction Codes Review 
Board as established in City of Robins Code of Ordinances Section 155.12. The 
Building Official or designated representative shall be an ex-officio member without 
a vote and shall act as secretary of the Board. 

 

The Board shall adopt reasonable rules and regulations for conducting its 

investigations and shall render all decisions and findings in writing to the Building 

Official with a duplicate copy to the appellant and may recommend to the City 

Council such new legislation as is consistent therewith.  The Board shall hold a 

regular meeting on the fourth Tuesday of each month, unless there are no appeals or 

business on file for a hearing. 

 

Nominal appeal fee to the Board of Appeals shall be paid as set forth in Table E-1 
SCHEDULE OF FEES as adopted by resolution of the City Council.  The appeal 
shall be valid for one (1) year from the date of the Board approval to the 
commencement of work and to the completion of work undertaken pursuant to the 
approval. 

 

The Board shall have no authority to interpretation of the administration of this 

code nor shall such board be empowered to waive requirements of this code. 

 

FAILURE TO ACT.  In case an appellant or applicant does not exercise his/her 

rights, act, begin construction or operation or occupancy, as the case may be, in 

accordance with any appeal, variance or permit granted by the Board within one year 

after the matter has been acted upon by the Board, such variance or permit shall 

become null and void. 



 

 

 

SECTION 5: Chapter 156.08 “Clear Space” for “Chapter 156 – ELECTRICAL CODE” is 

amended by deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

156.08   CLEAR SPACE. 

 

The Robins Electrical Code is hereby amended by adding a Section 110.26 (B)(1) to the 

National Electrical Code, 2023 Edition as follows: 

 

SECTION 110.26(B)(1) CLEAR SPACES.  For electrical equipment located in 

rooms that contain storage areas, the required working clearances as prescribed in 

this Article shall be maintained by providing approved rigid barriers and labels. 

 

Exception 1: Within individual residential dwelling units.  
 

Exception 2: Where barriers would obstruct exit pathways the authority having 

jurisdiction for enforcing this Code may grant an exception or approve an 

alternate method. 

 

Informational Note: Barriers shall be a minimum of 36 inches in height, the full 

width of the required working area and meet the load requirements as prescribed 

by the Building Code for guardrails. 

 

SECTION 6: Chapter 156.09 “Receptacles” for “Chapter 156 – ELECTRICAL CODE” is 

amended by deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

 

156.09  DWELLING UNITS. 

 

The Robins Electrical Code is hereby amended by deleting article 210.8(A), “Dwelling 

Units,” and inserting in lieu thereof the following new section: 

“210.8(A) Dwelling Units. 

All 123-volt, 15- and 20- ampere receptacles installed in the following locations and 

supplied by single-phase branch circuits rated 150 volts or less to ground shall have 

ground-fault circuit-interrupter protection for personnel: 

1. Bathrooms 

2. Garages 

3. Accessory buildings that have a floor located at or below ground level not 

intended as habitable rooms and limited to storage areas, work areas, and 

areas of similar use. 

4. Outdoors 

5. Crawl spaces – at or below grade level 

6. Basements 

7. Kitchens 



 

 

8. Areas with sinks and permanent provisions for food preparation, beverage 

preparation, or cooking, 

9. Sinks – where receptacles are installed within 1.8 m (6ft) of the outside edge 

of the bathtub or shower stall. 

10. Laundry areas. 

11. Indoor damp and wet locations” 

 

SECTION 7: Chapter 156.10 “Specific Appliances” for “Chapter 156 – ELECTRICAL 

CODE” is amended by deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

156.10  SPECIFIC APPLIANCES. 

 

The Robins Electrical Code is hereby amended by deleting article 210.8(D), “Specific 

Appliances,” and inserting in lieu thereof the following new section 

 

“210.8(D) Specific Appliances. 

GFCI protection shall be provided for the branch circuit or outlet supplying the 

following appliances rated 150 volts or less to ground and 60 amperes or less, 

single- or 3-phase: 

 

1. Automotive vacuum machines 

2. Drinking water coolers and bottle fill stations 

3. High-pressure spray washing machines 

4. Tire inflation machines 

5. Vending machines 

6. Sump pumps 

7. Dishwashers 

8. Microwave ovens” 

 

SECTION 8: Chapter 156.11 “Outdoor Outlets” for “Chapter 156 – ELECTRICAL 

CODE” is amended by deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following 

 

156.11  SERVICES. 

 

1. The Robins Electrical Code is hereby amended by adding a second paragraph to 

Section 230.26 of the National Electrical Code, 2023 Edition, as follows: 

 

Where a service mast is used for the support of service drop conductors, the 

service raceway shall be a minimum of two-inch (2") rigid galvanized steel 

conduit, and possess the ability to withstand safely the strain imposed by the 

service-drop or overhead service conductors. Hubs intended for use with a 

conduit that serves as a service mast shall be identified for use with service-

entrance equipment. 

 



 

 

SECTION 12: Chapter 156.12 “Uses Permitted” for “Chapter 156 – ELECTRICAL CODE” 

is amended by deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

156.12  CONFLICTS.  

 

If conflicts arise in requirements with regards to specifications of materials or methods 

between portions of this code, between this code and other local codes or between this 

code and applicable State or federal requirements, the more stringent shall apply. 

 

SECTION 13: Chapter 156.12 “Uses Permitted” for “Chapter 156 – ELECTRICAL CODE” 

is amended by deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the following: 

 

156.12 LICENSING OF ELECTRICIANS.   

 

1. Title and purpose. This section shall be known as the "City of Robins, Iowa, 

Electrical Licensing Code." The purpose of this section is to provide for the licensing 

and insuring of electrical apprentices, journeymen and contractors in order to protect 

public health, safety and welfare.   

2. Licensing required. No person shall install, alter, and add to, repair, relocate, replace 

or maintain any electrical system within the City unless such person meets the 

requirements of rules for State of Iowa licensing as established by the State of Iowa 

Electrical Examining Board, and has obtained a permit for said electrical work from the 

Building Official according to the provisions of the Robins Electrical Code.   

3. Violations. Violations of this section shall be punished as provided in 1.14 of the 

Code of Ordinances or may be cited as a municipal infraction under Chapter 3 of the 

Code of Ordinances.   

 

SECTION 14: Repealed. All Ordinances or parts thereof in conflict with the provisions of the 

Ordinance are repealed. 

 

SECTION 15: Severability. If any section, provision, or part of the Ordinance shall be adjudged 

invalid or unconstitutional, such adjudication shall not affect the validity of the Ordinance as a 

whole or ay section, provision, or part thereof not adjudged invalid or unconstitutional. 

 

SECTION 16:  Effective Date. This Ordinance shall be in effect from and after its final passage, 

approval, and publication as provided by law. 

 

PASSED AND APPROVED this _____ day of ________ 2025 

 

___________________________ 

Chuck Hinz, Mayor 

ATTEST: 

 

________________________ 

Lisa Goodin, City Clerk/Treasurer 
  



RESOLUTION NO. 0925-8 

A RESOLUTION SETTING A PUBLIC HEARING DATE TO HEAR QUESTIONS AND 

CONCERNS RELATING TO THE RE-ZONING OF CERTAIN PROPERTIES WITHIN 

THE BOUNDARIES OF THE CITY OF ROBINS 

WHEREAS, the City of Robins seeks to re-zone certain properties located within the corporate 

boundaries of the City of Robins to align with their permitted uses and Chapter 165 – Zoning of 

the Robins Code of Ordinances; and 

WHEREAS, pursuant to Chapter 414 of the Code of Iowa and Chapter 165 of the Robins Code 

of Ordinances, the City Council is required to hold a public hearing prior to taking action on 

zoning changes; and 

WHEREAS, the City Council desires to provide property owners and residents the opportunity to 

ask questions and express concerns regarding the proposed re-zoning. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Robins, Iowa, that: 

1. A Public Hearing shall be held before the Robins City Council at 6:00 p.m. on 

November 3, at Robins City Hall, 265 South Second Avenue, Robins, Iowa, for the 

purpose of receiving public comment and concerns relating to the proposed re-zoning of 

certain properties within the City. 

2. The City Clerk is hereby directed to cause notice of said Public Hearing to be published 

in accordance with the requirements of the Code of Iowa. 

PASSED AND APPROVED this 22nd day of September, 2025. 

 

CITY OF ROBINS, IOWA 

 

____________________________ 

Chuck Hinz, Mayor 

ATTEST: 

 

____________________________ 

Lisa Goodin, City Clerk/Treasurer 

 



 

RESOLUTION NO. 0925-9 

A RESOLUTION SETTING A PUBLIC HEARING TO HEAR QUESTIONS AND 

CONCERNS RELATING TO AMENDMENT NO. 1 TO THE  

FISCAL YEAR 2026 BUDGET 

 

WHEREAS, the City of Robins is required under the Code of Iowa to amend its annual budget 

when changes in revenues or expenditures occur; and 

WHEREAS, the City of Robins has prepared Amendment No. 1 to the Fiscal Year 2026 Budget 

to reflect such changes; and 

WHEREAS, prior to adoption, the City Council must hold a public hearing to receive questions 

and concerns from residents and taxpayers relating to the proposed amendment. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Robins, Iowa, that: 

1. A Public Hearing shall be held before the Robins City Council at 6:00 p.m. on October 

20, 2025 at Robins City Hall, 265 South Second Avenue, Robins, Iowa, for the purpose 

of receiving questions and concerns relating to Amendment No. 1 to the Fiscal Year 2026 

Budget. 

2. The City Clerk is hereby directed to cause notice of said Public Hearing to be published 

in accordance with the requirements of the Code of Iowa. 

PASSED AND APPROVED this 22nd day of September, 2025. 

CITY OF ROBINS, IOWA 

 

______________________________ 

Chuck Hinz, Mayor 

ATTEST: 

 

______________________________ 

Lisa Goodin, City Clerk/Treasurer 

 



CITY OF ROBINS 

RESOLUTION NO. 0925-10 

A RESOLUTION APPROVING THE CITY OF ROBINS MUNICIPAL DEBRIS 

MANAGEMENT PLAN 

WHEREAS, the City of Robins has prepared a Debris Management Plan to guide local officials 

in making timely and cost-effective decisions regarding debris removal following an emergency 

or disaster; and 

WHEREAS, the Debris Management Plan establishes priorities, identifies staging areas, 

designates responsible personnel, and outlines strategies to ensure public health, safety, and 

welfare are protected; and 

WHEREAS, adoption of the Debris Management Plan enhances the City’s preparedness, 

streamlines emergency response operations, and supports potential reimbursement eligibility 

under state and federal disaster assistance programs; and 

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Robins finds it to be in the best interest of the City 

and its residents to formally adopt the Debris Management Plan. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Robins, Iowa, that: 

1. The attached City of Robins Municipal Debris Management Plan is hereby approved 

and adopted as the official plan of the City of Robins for debris management. 

2. The Public Works Superintendent and Deputy Superintendent are designated as the 

primary officials responsible for implementing the plan, coordinating with Linn County 

Emergency Management and other agencies as necessary. 

PASSED AND APPROVED this 22nd day of September, 2025. 

CITY OF ROBINS, IOWA 

______________________________ 

Chuck Hinz, Mayor 

ATTEST: 

______________________________ 

Lisa Goodin, City Clerk/Treasurer 

 



City of Robins Municipal Emergency 
Response Plan 

Debris Management Plan 
 

 
 
 
 
 

This document outlines the basic considerations for debris management in the city of Robins and is 
intended to be used by local officials to quickly make decisions that will speed up the process and reduce 
the costs of debris removal as well as return public and private residents to normal conditions. This 
document is not intended to be comprehensive of all debris management and emergency response 
concerns. For additional information, consult the Linn County Emergency Management Debris 
Management Plan. 
 
In the event of an incident or event involving large amounts of debris in the city of Robins, the city Public 
Works Superintendent, Mike Kortenkamp & Public Works Deputy Superintendent, Neal Boeckmann will 
act as primary points of contact for debris related concerns. Mike can be reached 24hrs by phone at 
(319)588-6641, or by email at mike.kortenkamp@cityofrobins.org. Neal can be reached 24hrs by phone 
at (319)360-5630, or by email at firecodeofficial@cityofrobins.org. 
 
Primary Rapid Damage Assessment (windshield survey) will be carried out by Public Works 
Superintendent/Deputy Superintendent. To establish the extent of debris and begin contemplating 
community needs. 
 

City of Robins Priorities for Debris Removal: 
 

• Rescue of people and lifesaving operations 

• Movement of Essential Governmental personnel, fire, police, and Emergency Operations Center 
(EOC) personnel  

• Access to hospitals, jail and shelters  

• Major traffic routes  

• Major flood drainage ways  

• Drinking water sources 

• Points of Distribution (PODs) and mutual aid assembly areas  

• Government facilities  

• Schools and childcare facilities 

• Public Safety communications towers  

• Debris storage sites  

• Secondary roads  

• Access for utility restoration  

• Neighborhood streets  

• Private property adversely affecting public welfare  
 

Emergency Debris Management Contacts: 
Linn County Emergency Management Agency: (319) 892-6500 
Cedar Rapids/ Linn County Solid Waste Agency: (319) 377-5290  
Linn County Public Health, Environmental Health: 24hr (319) 892-6050 
City of Robins Primary Insurance Agent: 

Roger Batterson, The Accel Group (319)365-8611 

  



City of Robins Municipal Emergency Response Plan 
Debris Management Plan 

9/22/2025  2 
 

Debris Staging Area(s) 
The city of Robins will utilize the following locations as debris staging areas: 
 

Location Description Special restrictions  Approved by LCPH 

South Troy Park 
700 S. Troy Rd. 
 
 
 
 

City Park w/ Parking 
Lots & Baseball 
Outfields 

No open burning Yes 

 
Preferred Hauling Company  
The City of Robins uses Miene Septic as their primary hauler. Bids for emergency debris 
hauling/transportation to (TBD) have not been established.  
 

Secondary Hauling Company (if primary hauler is not available or cannot furnish enough resources: 
The City of Robins has identified ABC Disposal as a secondary hauler for emergency removal of debris in 
the case that Miene Septic is not available or cannot furnish enough equipment to quickly haul the 
amount of debris generated.  
 

Endpoint For Garbage & Direct Account Or Bill To Hauler 
General Disposal Site: 
The city of Robins has an account set up with the Cedar Rapids/ Linn County Solid Waste Agency to 
accept debris and bill the City of Robins.  
 
Scrap Metal Vendor: 
The city of Robins utilizes Marion Iron. For Scrap metal, vehicles, etc. 
 
See Debris types and sorting for more information on different types of debris and their basic removal 
strategy. 
 

List of Available Equipment: 

Equipment Description Person in Charge of 
Equipment 

Location of Equipment 24/7 Point of contact  

2 Dump Trucks Neal Boeckmann 145 Maxfield Ln. Boeckmann/Kortenkamp 

1 Loader/Backhoe Neal Boeckmann 145 Maxfield Ln. Boeckmann/Kortenkamp 

1 Skid Loader Neal Boeckmann 145 Maxfield Ln. Boeckmann/Kortenkamp 

3 Mobile Generators Neal Boeckmann 145 Maxfield Ln. Boeckmann/Kortenkamp 

1 JD Tractor Neal Boeckmann 145 Maxfield Ln. Boeckmann/Kortenkamp 

5 Chainsaws Neal Boeckmann 145 Maxfield Ln. Boeckmann/Kortenkamp 

1 18k Flatbed Trailer Neal Boeckmann 145 Maxfield Ln. Boeckmann/Kortenkamp 

3 Carry-on Trailers 
(Lightweight) 

Neal Boeckmann 145 Maxfield Ln. Boeckmann/Kortenkamp 

2 F550 Dump Bed 
Pickups 

Neal Boeckmann 145 Maxfield Ln. Boeckmann/Kortenkamp 



City of Robins Municipal Emergency Response Plan 
Debris Management Plan 

9/22/2025  3 
 

If additional equipment is needed from outside the city, county, or state contact Linn County Emergency 

Management to carry out a formal IMAC (Iowa Mutual Aid Compact) request. 

Secondary Sources for Equipment: 
Rexco Rental Company 
 

Public Outreach and Media: 
In the event of widespread debris involving multiple private properties the city Robins, will conduct 
citizen outreach via the City’s website, the City’s E-Newsletter, as well as a press release to the local TV 
news outlet. This communication will contain instructions/details concerning the following: 
 

• Instructions on sorting of debris on private property or right-of-way 

• Staging area locations 

• Special garbage removal  

• Household Hazardous Waste Removal 
 
 
 



City of Robins Municipal Emergency Response Plan 
Debris Management Plan 

9/22/2025  4 
 

Basic Debris Types & Basic Removal Strategies 
Debris Type Example Basic Local Strategy for removal 

Debris Subject to 
Putrefaction 

Debris that will decompose or rot including animal 
remains, food remnants, etc. 

Deploy roll-off dumpsters provided by ABC Disposal and located at 700 S. Troy Rd. 

Vegetation Debris Whole trees, leaves, branches, shrubs and other 
leafy material 

Material collected at 700 S. Troy Rd. 

Inert 
environmental 
debris 

Dirt, rocks, mud, sand, corn stalks (not 
contaminated by hazardous wastes). 

City staff will establish &maintain access on local streets and public rights-of-way. 

Construction and 
demolition debris 

Components of buildings and structures, including 
acrylic; asphalt; blinds; brick; carpet; concrete; 
drywall; electrical wires and electronics; glass; 
insulation (fiberglass, styrofoam etc.); masonry; 
metals (steel, aluminum, copper etc.); plastic; 
pipes; tiles; vinyl; wood 

Deploy roll-off dumpsters provided by ABC Disposal.  

Household effects  
and furniture 

Beds/mattresses; desks, chairs, chests; upholstered 
furniture; lamps; sofas; large appliances 

These types of debris are treated as regular garbage by CR/LC Solid Waste Agency. 

Appliances 
(White Goods) 

Water heaters, washing machines, air conditioners, 
stoves, refrigerators, etc. 

Appliance disposal is federally regulated and must be completed by approved licensed haulers. 
The City of Robins utilizes CR/LC Solid Waste Agency to properly dispose of appliances. 

Personal items Computers, phones, photographs, art, clothing, 
books, papers, cooking utensils, dishes and 
glassware 

Robins City Hall, 265 S. 2nd St, will function as a central location for collecting, documenting, and 
reunifying select personal belongings 

Hazardous wastes oils; chemicals; paints; cleaning agents; pesticides; 
combustibles; radioactive* substances*; 
explosives*; solvents; fertilizers; lead; illegal 
substances; other hazardous materials 

Large quantities of Hazardous wastes may require response from Hazardous Materials Response 
Team(s)  
Household Hazardous Materials HHW) MUST be separate from other debris and removed by a 
licensed contractor. 

Special and 
regulated waste 

Asbestos, biomedical waste*, computer 
equipment, electronics, ammunition*, 
medications*, sharps from residents* 

Separate from regular debris. Coordinate with CR/LC Solid Waste Agency and/or Linn County 
EMA prior to transportation. 

Vehicles Vehicles may be classified as debris if they block 
public access and critical facilities; examples could 
include abandoned vehicles; cars; boats; ATVs 

Private Citizens will need to consult with their insurance provider. Vehicles blocking emergency 
operations may need to be moved. 

*Materials ARE NOT ACCEPTED by Cedar Rapids/ Linn County Solid Waste Agency without proper coordination through Linn County Emergency 

Management, Cedar Rapids/ Linn County Solid Waste Agency, and Linn County Public Health or Local Law Enforcement prior to transportation/ 

hauling.



City of Robins Municipal Emergency Response Plan 
Debris Management Plan 

9/22/2025  5 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

[This Page Intentionally Left Blank] 




